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Event: Special Session of the Governing Council of SACEP-20-21 January 2003, 
Hilton Colombo, Sri Lanlm 

Environment Ministers of 

South Asia meet in Color.abo 


A tll'o-d,ly meeting 
of tht: Govern ing Coun­
cil of South Asia Coop­
el'ati\'c Envirof!ment 
Program me (SA CEP) 
is to be' held from 20-21 
Jall uar)' in Colombo, 
undt: r the pat ronage of 
th t: Sri Lankan Minister 
for Env ironment Hon. 

Ruk ma n Senanayake 
who is its prese nt chair­
man. The most impor­
tant agenda item of the 
mccl ing is to finali se a 
work programme to 
follow up recommen­
dati ons of the recently 
held World Summi t on 
Sustainable Deve lop­

ment tWSSD) at the 
South Asia n SlIb 
Regional Level. 

This event will be 
attended by the Envi­
ronmen tal Mmis ters of 
Banglades h. Bhutan. 
Mald ives. Nep:ll. P,lk­
istan and Sr ~ Lanka 
while India ~vill be rep­
resen ted by a high leve l 
delegation. SAA RC 
Secretary General and 
observers fr om several 
lntemational Organisa­
tions \vill also be pre­
sent at the m~eting. 


